BID TABULATION — PURCHASE OF PAINT, RJS - BID #16-10 - DUE DATE/TIME: 04/06/17 @ 10:00AM
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Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the lowest listed
cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive and responsible bid PPG Paint
package. Tampa Sports Authority staff must complete a detailed amnts Chadwell Supply Interbay Coatings
evaluation of each bid package submitted and, once the
evaluation of all bids submitted is complete, the bid will be
awarded to the bidder who is most responsive and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes.
DESCRIPTION UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Solvent Based Dry-Fall Semi-Gloss Paint or its Comparable $33.07 $14.40 $25.50
Equal
Pitt-Tech Gloss, Brand Only (No Subs unless proven equal) $27.38 $32.60 $29.90
Series 90-374 Bell Tower
Pitt-Tech Gloss, Brand Only (No Subs unless proven equal) $44.17 $37.00 $44.65
Series 90-306 Safety Red tinted to Buccaneer Red
GRAND TOTAL $18,689.50 $16,354.00 $18,176.50
Signed General Terms & Conditions Received Not Received Received
Signed Guarantee of Bid Proposal Received Received Received
Acknowledgment of Addendum(s), if applicable Received Received Addendum #1 only Received
Acknowledgment of Bidder, If Corporation Received Received Received
Acknowledgment of Bidder, If a Partnership or Individual N/A N/A N/A
Acknowledgment of Principal, If Corporation Received Received Received
Legal Status of Bidder Received Received Received
Bidder Reference/Qualification Form Received Received Received
Statement of No Bid N/A N/A N/A
Bid Checklist Received Received Received

Notes:

Submitted wrong bid form;
Missing Add. #2. Line Item #1
doesn’t match “Exterior”
requirements; submitted

“Interior”. Line 3 wrong product.




BID TABULATION — PURCHASE OF PAINT, RJS - BID #16-10 - DUE DATE/TIME: 04/06/17 @ 10:00AM

\% E N D 0 R S
Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the lowest listed
cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive and responsible bid Sh in Willi
package. Tampa Sports Authority staff must complete a detailed erwin Wifiams Dyco Paints/ Mine & Mill/
evaluat%on of each bid pa}ckage? submitted and, _once the Sun Paints & Coatings Bert Lowe Supply
evaluation of all bids submitted is complete, the bid will be
awarded to the bidder who is most responsive and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes.
DESCRIPTION UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Solvent Based Dry-Fall Semi-Gloss Paint or its Comparable $9.25 $26.65 $22.40
Equal
Pitt-Tech Gloss, Brand Only (No Subs unless proven equal) $23.85 $28.00 No Bid
Series 90-374 Bell Tower
Pitt-Tech Gloss, Brand Only (No Subs unless proven equal) $23.85 $72.65 No Bid
Series 90-306 Safety Red tinted to Buccaneer Red
GRAND TOTAL $11,443.50 $20,295.50 $4,032
Signed General Terms & Conditions Received Received Received
Signed Guarantee of Bid Proposal Received Received Received
Acknowledgment of Addendum(s), if applicable Received Received Received
Acknowledgment of Bidder, If Corporation Received Received Received
Acknowledgment of Bidder, If a Partnership or Individual N/A N/A N/A
Acknowledgment of Principal, If Corporation Received Received Received
Legal Status of Bidder Received Received Received
Bidder Reference/Qualification Form Received Not Received Received
Statement of No Bid N/A N/A N/A
Bid Checklist (Not a mandatory form) Received Received Not Received
Notes: Wrong bid form used. Add. Incomplete bid

#2 had replacement bid forms.




BID TABULATION — PURCHASE OF PAINT, RJS - BID #16-10 - DUE DATE/TIME: 04/06/17 @ 10:00AM
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Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the lowest listed
cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive and responsible bid
package. Tampa Sports Authority staff must complete a detailed
evaluation of each bid package submitted and, once the
evaluation of all bids submitted is complete, the bid will be
awarded to the bidder who is most responsive and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes.

Tiles in Style

DESCRIPTION UNIT COST
Solvent Based Dry-Fall Semi-Gloss Paint or its Comparable $18.58

Equal

Pitt-Tech Gloss, Brand Only (No Subs unless proven equal) $38.44

Series 90-374 Bell Tower

Pitt-Tech Gloss, Brand Only (No Subs unless proven equal) $25.18

Series 90-306 Safety Red tinted to Buccaneer Red

GRAND TOTAL $17,912.28

Signed General Terms & Conditions Received

Signed Guarantee of Bid Proposal Received
Acknowledgment of Addendum(s), if applicable Not Acknowledged
Acknowledgment of Bidder, If Corporation Received
Acknowledgment of Bidder, If a Partnership or Individual N/A
Acknowledgment of Principal, If Corporation Received

Legal Status of Bidder Received

Bidder Reference/Qualification Form Received
Statement of No Bid N/A

Bid Checklist (Not a mandatory form) Received

Notes:

Doesn’t meet specs. Wrong

bid form; Did not use Add.

#2’s revised bid forms.
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