

BID #18-13: Red Seat Paint, RJS – Bid Opening 4/26/19 @ 10am

BIDDERS

<p>Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive and responsible bid package. Tampa Sports Authority staff must complete a detailed evaluation of each bid package submitted and, once the evaluation of all bids submitted is complete, the bid will be awarded to the lowest cost responsive bid submitted by a responsive, responsible vendor as required by Florida Statutes.</p>									
	Qty: 80 (5 Gallon Bucket) Component A Polysiloxane	405.44	366.00	230.00	349.50	NO BID			
	Qty: 80 (1 Gallon Containers) – Component B Hardener	104.56	109.75	70.00	100.00	NO BID			
EXTENDED GRAND TOTAL	40,800	38,060	24,000	35,960	NO BID				

ALTERNATES:

Per 1 Gallon	Polysiloxane – Component A	63.93	75.00	48.00	72.00	NO BID			
Per 1 Quart	Hardener – Component B	38.0	24.40	15.00	22.00	NO BID			

Guarantee of Bid Proposal	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Acknowledgment of Addenda	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Acknowledgment of Bidder	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Acknowledgment of Principal	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Legal Status of Bidder	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Bidder Qualification Form	✓	Incomplete	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Public Entity Statement	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Relationship Disclosure	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Drug-Free Acknowledgment	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Statement of No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Bid Checklist (Non-Mandatory)	None	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓